



## Bid Tabulation

Village of St. Paris  
Sanitary Manhole Rehabilitation  
June 8, 2017

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE	APPROX. QTY.	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	Municipal & Contractors Sealing Products Cincinnati, OH		Conco Spray Solutions, LLC Indianapolis, IN		Culy Contracting, Inc. Winchester, IN		Front Range Environmental LLC McHenry, IL		Lake County Sewer Co., Inc. Willowick, OH		Advanced Rehabilitation Technology Bryan, OH		Mechanical Jobbers Marketing Lithonia, GA	
						UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST
<b>BASE BID</b>																			
SPEC	SANITARY MANHOLE REHABILITATION, AS PER PLAN	VER. FT.	713.48	\$280.00	\$199,774.40	\$110.00	\$78,482.80	\$190.00	\$135,561.20	\$202.00	\$144,122.96	\$205.00	\$146,263.40	\$226.00	\$161,246.48	\$243.00	\$173,375.64	\$288.84	\$206,081.56
					<b>\$199,774.40</b>		<b>\$78,482.80</b>		<b>\$135,561.20</b>		<b>\$144,122.96</b>		<b>\$146,263.40</b>		<b>\$161,246.48</b>		<b>\$173,375.64</b>		<b>\$206,081.56</b>
<b>ALTERNATE 1</b>																			
SPEC	SANITARY MANHOLE REHABILITATION, AS PER PLAN	VER. FT.	713.48	\$280.00	\$199,774.40	\$230.00	\$164,100.40	\$160.00	\$114,156.80	\$151.00	\$107,735.48	\$225.00	\$160,533.00	\$260.00	\$185,504.80	No Bid		\$243.93	\$174,039.18
					<b>\$199,774.40</b>		<b>\$164,100.40</b>		<b>\$114,156.80</b>		<b>\$107,735.48</b>		<b>\$160,533.00</b>		<b>\$185,504.80</b>				<b>\$174,039.18</b>
<b>ALTERNATE 2</b>																			
SPEC	SANITARY MANHOLE REHABILITATION, AS PER PLAN	VER. FT.	713.48	\$280.00	\$199,774.40	\$85.00	\$60,645.80	\$268.00	\$191,212.64	\$121.00	\$86,331.08	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$321.35	\$229,276.80
					<b>\$199,774.40</b>		<b>\$60,645.80</b>		<b>\$191,212.64</b>		<b>\$86,331.08</b>								<b>\$229,276.80</b>
<b>ALTERNATE 3</b>																			
SPEC	SANITARY MANHOLE REHABILITATION, AS PER PLAN	VER. FT.	713.48	\$280.00	\$199,774.40	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$400.00	\$285,392.00
					<b>\$199,774.40</b>														<b>\$285,392.00</b>